
 CORPORATE

INTERNATIONAL & DOMESTIC 
ARBITRATION

GENERAL & CIVIL LITIGATION

Our corporate department provides a range of 
services in all aspects of corporate and securities 
law. Our scope of work includes the rendering of 
legal advice and preparation of documentation in 
relation to, amongst others, sale and purchase of 
shares and other securities, leveraged buy-outs, 
takeovers, acquisitions of businesses and 
undertakings of companies.  

Email our Dept. Head, Patricia David Saini 
(patdavid@shooklin.com.my) for more info.  

BANKING & FINANCE

The banking and finance practice of the firm 
provides services across all areas of transactions 
and products in banking and finance.  

Email our Dept. Head, Lai Wing Yong 
(wylai@shooklin.com.my) for more info. 

INSURANCE & SHIPPING

We offer advisory and litigation services in the 
fields of general and life insurance and re-
insurance, and we also handle all aspects of 
contentious and non-contentious marine, aviation 
and other transportation matters, including 
insurance contracts. Email our Dept. Head, 
Nagarajah Muttiah (naga@shooklin.com.my) for 
more info. 

Our department represents clients in transactions 
related to, amongst others, sale and purchase of 
movable properties and landed properties, joint 
venture agreements over real estate, tenancies 
and leases, private wealth management and 
planning and Will writing.  

Email our Dept. Head, Lai Wing Yong for more 
info.  

BANKING & FINANCE LITIGATION

We handle litigation relating to debt recovery, 
land security, Islamic finance, receiverships, 
inso lvenc ies , schemes of a r rangement/ 
restructuring, private debt securities, initial public 
offerings as well as trouble-shoot problems 
including defending financial institutions against 
legal claims.  Email our Dept. Head, Yoong Sin 
Min (smyoong@shooklin.com.my) for more info. 

ISLAMIC FINANCE

Our lawyers are skilled in the dual disciplines of 
Islamic Finance and Conventional Finance and 
this enhances the Department’s breadth and 
depth of advice. Email our Dept. Head, Jalalullail 
Othman (jal@shooklin.com.my) for more info.

The firm has been noted in international legal 
guides as having one of the best civil litigation / 
dispute resolution practices. An integral aspect 
of the service we provide is to advise clients on 
overall litigation strategy especially in complex 
disputes, and also to participate, lead and 
advise clients in any settlement negotiations.  
Email our Dept. Head, Nagarajah Muttiah for 
more info. 

INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY, 
INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY & 

LICENSING

The firm's practice in the areas of intellectual 
and industrial property, information technology 
and licensing law handles applications, filing and 
prosecution, in respect of trade marks, service 
marks, patents, utility innovations and designs, 
for local and international clients. In the area of 
copyright protection, we deal with the 
documentation relating to the protection, 
subsistence, ownership and assignment of 
copyright. Email our Dept. Head, Michael Soo 
(michaelsoo@shooklin.com.my) for more info.

 FAMILY, PROBATE & TRUSTS

We handle a wide range of family matters, 
including divorce, judicial separation, adoption 
and unilateral conversion of minors. Email our 
Dept. Head, Steven Thiruneelakandan 
(stevent@shooklin.com.my) for more info.

REAL ESTATE, COMMERCIAL & 
CONVEYANCING

We regularly act for clients in all aspects of 
construction  and engineering work, including 
litigation and arbitration. Email our Dept. Head, 
Nagarajah Muttiah for more info.
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LABOUR & INDUSTRIAL DISPUTE

We provide a whole host of services, both in 
advisory and litigation work, including advice on 
dismissals/ constructive dismissals, drafting of 
terms and conditions of employment.  

Email our Dept. Head, Romesh Abraham 
(romesh@shooklin.com.my) for more info.

TAX & REVENUE

We render advice on matters relating to income 
tax, customs and excise duties, sales and service 
tax, and provide representation and advocacy in 
income tax appeals.  

Email our Dept. Head, Steven Thiruneelakandan 
for more info.

COMPANY SECRETARIAL

We provide services concerning the formation 
and administration of companies and business 
entities, and their compliance with laws. Email our 
Dept. Head, Patricia David Saini for more info.

LOAN & DEBT RESTRUCTURING

TECHNOLOGY, MULTIMEDIA & 
TELECOMMUNICATIONS (“TMT”) LAW

COMPETITION & ANTI-TRUST LAW

We advise on all matters relating to 
competition law, and provide representation 
and advocacy before the relevant commission, 
tribunal and courts.  

E m a i l o u r D e p t . H e a d , S t e v e n 
Thiruneelakandan for more info.

We have a dedicated team of lawyers advising 
on all aspects of debt restructuring, with 
extensive experience in the sale and acquisition 
of distressed debts and non-performing loans.  

Email our Dept. Head, Khong Mei Lin 
(meilinkhong@shooklin.com.my) for more info. 

SHOOK LIN & BOK 
EST. 1918 

Advocates & Solicitors 
Notary Public 

Commissioner for Oaths 
Registered Trade Mark Agents 

Registered Patent Agents 
Registered Industrial Design Agents 

20th. Floor, AmBank Group Building,  
55 Jalan Raja Chulan, 50200 Kuala Lumpur, 

Malaysia. 
Tel: +60320311788 

Fax: +60320311775 / 8 / 9 
Email: general@shooklin.com.my 

www.shooklin.com.my 

We provide a diverse range of legal services 
tailored to the needs of companies and 
individuals alike in the TMT industries, 
including hardware, software and services 
procurement, privacy and data protection, 
regulatory issues, cyber security and dispute 
resolution.  

E m a i l o u r D e p t . H e a d , I v a n H o 
(ivanycho@shooklin.com.my) for more info. 

BUILDING, CONSTRUCTION & 
ENGINEERING

Our services range from advisory and 
documentation to dispute resolution via 
litigation, arbitration, adjudication (in 
particular under the Construction Industry 
Payment and Adjudication Act 2012 (CIPAA)) 
and other alternative dispute resolution 
processes. 

Email our Dept. Head, Lam Ko Luen 
(koluen@shooklin.com.my) for more info.
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